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Tim Erblich: So what we’ve seen over 
the last several years is that there are 
situations where Microsoft weighs in 
on really pressing and important soci-
etal issues. For example, you came up 
very strongly about DACA (Deferred Ac-
tion for Childhood Arrivals), and you’ve 
been a leader in diversity and inclusion 
for a long time, and immigration, and so 
on. Some would say this is not a natural 
place for corporations to have such a 
loud and powerful voice. What makes 
you do this? What’s the driver behind 
these stances? 

Brad Smith: I think we live in a fascinat-
ing time. There is more hunger, I think 
hunger is the right word, for companies to 
address broad issues. I think it naturally, 
and rightly, it is mostly focused on the 
connection between companies and the 
issues they touch, because of the prod-
ucts that they create, the services they 
provide and the needs of their employees. 
A decade ago we would have been much 
quieter, and yet what we’re seeing in the 
marketplace, from the public and from 
our employees, is frankly a desire to see 
companies address societal challenges 
more broadly and boldly than before. 

TE When you think about the rule of law 
and how it operates in Microsoft, oper-
ates around the globe, you know, in the 
sense of fair play, a sense of decency – 
how does this really connect to values-
based leadership? 

BS Well, the first question is, what are our 
values? It certainly has caused us to step 
back and ask, what are the values that are 
timeless? What are the values that are 
core to our mission? You know, among 
them is a commitment to the broad pro-
tection of human rights. It’s an easy thing 
to say. It’s actually a complicated thing to 
do. I think it starts with a commitment to 
do no harm, that we manage our own 
business in a way that is sensitive to and 
protective of other people’s human rights. 
But it ultimately extends to questions 
like, can we use technology to protect hu-
man rights? 

TE You saw the Larry Fink letter. Larry 
Fink runs Blackrock, which is the big-
gest asset manager in the world, and he 
was calling on companies like yours to in 
a sense be social activists, or to be lead-
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ers on social issues around the globe, 
and he was saying that is the recipe for 
long-term sustained performance in the 
world in which we operate today. Can 
you talk a little bit about that for a sec-
ond? 

BS I think you have to first start with the 
why. Why should companies do this, or 
more precisely, why are people asking 
companies to do this? And there’s a few 
data points that all sort of push us for-
ward. The first is that companies that are 
thinking about something bigger than 
themselves, and are thinking about their 
broad societal mission and contribution, 
are likely to create more value for custom-
ers and shareholders over the long term. 
Right? So that’s the first point. I think 
coming from the other end is really em-
ployees. Employees today are asking their 
employers to take on issues that matter to 
them, to speak out and especially to ad-
dress these issues when they relate to 
their needs, and they have high expecta-
tions. 

TE We collect a lot of data, and our thesis 
at Ethisphere is that companies that are 
better citizens outperform over the long 
term, but what’s underneath is that they 
attract and retain the best employees. 

BS You raised an incredibly important 
point about employees in our business. 
Indeed, in so many businesses today, you 
are nothing without attracting and re-
taining great employees. When you think 
about trust, for example, you have to re-
tain the trust of so many different groups 
of stakeholders, but I actually think you 
have to start by retaining the trust of 
your employees. I think that’s a healthy 
thing, because employees these days 
have such high expectations that if you 
do well in sustaining their trust, especial-
ly with a large organization and a large 
number of employees, a global workforce, 
you’re probably going to be pretty well-
positioned to retain other people’s trust 
too. 

TE Then the next step is, how do you be a 
really good corporate citizen in the com-
munities in which you operate around 
the globe? You were talking little bit 
about DACA. It’s a humanitarian issue. 
It’s an economic issue. Talk a little bit 
more about that. 

BS We found our voice quickly on DACA. 
There were a few of us who talked the 
weekend when we saw that the White 

House decision was looming, and we de-
cided that we would put a stake in the 
ground. We felt it was a business impera-
tive for the company because we have 45 
employees who are registered under 
DACA, and we wanted to them to know 
that we had their back. 

We used pretty strong language. We 
would put the weight of the company 
behind them. We would ensure they had 
their own legal representation and we 
would go to court and stand by their side. 
I also think it’s a humanitarian impera-
tive. The numbers are large, 800,000 or so, 
but I think it’s more than that. 

There’s an aspect about DACA that is fair-
ly unique. So many of these people have 
never lived in their memory anywhere 
outside the United States, so to deport 
them is not to deport them to their home. 
It is to deport them away from their 
home. Any time you’re facing that kind of 
issue, I think one does need to address it 
with more urgency than others. 

TE So how have all of these things con-
nected into really a high performing 
company? Diversity, inclusion, CSR, tak-
ing a stand on things that are important. 
What’s the secret sauce here for compa-
nies? 

BS Well, one of the reasons that we are so 
enthusiastic about the work that Ethis-
phere does is, in my opinion, you help 
companies find their voice. I think finding 
your voice really requires two things. One 
is that you have to know the values for 
which you stand. And the other is that 
you have to have some courage. I think 
that you remind us that there are values 
that transcend individual companies, or 
even the private sector as a whole. But the 
other thing that I have found so interest-
ing in talking with people who do CSR 
work at other companies is that often-
times it’s the first step that’s the hardest. 
They have to persuade the leaders of the 
company, or others, to have the courage to 
speak out. 

TE I have always found myself that it’s 
not a bad thing to have somebody else 
you can point to as a model, or as an ex-
ample. I think Ethisphere provides some 
of that. It’s what we’ve tried to do. And 
that’s what I’ve tried to do as we’ve had 
more years of experience doing this. 

BS I think back to the first time we took a 
position on immigration, that was not an 

easy decision necessarily to make as a 
company or to overcome internal debate. 
But you find your voice and you know, 
frankly, you see how it goes. And if it goes 
well, then you’re prepared to take the 
next step. We live at a time where I do 
think companies need to find their voice 
and summon their courage and the more 
that we can do to help others do that, I 
think the better off we all are. 

TE Do you believe, or does Microsoft the 
company believe, that this leads to great-
er business success? Because you are a 
publicly traded company. Does all of this 
link to business success? 

BS I believe that a strong ethical commit-
ment, and even the use of a corporate 
voice in an appropriate way, is linked to 
business success. It’s certainly linked in 
our business. 

With the advent of cloud computing, 
people are entrusting us oftentimes with 
their most precious data, which is being 
stored in our data centers. They have to 
trust us, or we will not be successful. We 
won’t continue to obtain their business. 
It really calls on us to think about how to 
internalize that in a broad array of ways. 
But as we do that, as we speak out, we take 
the steps that hopefully sustain people’s 
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to get it out there. And you have to move 
fast, and you don’t move fast unless you 
put the groundwork in place beforehand. 

TE Right? It was great to watch. You 
guys have been very engaged with our 
community of companies and Ethis-
phere thanks you, and we look forward 
to another 43 or 50 years, we look for-
ward to you continuing to raise the bar, 
continuing to have that growth mindset 
on character and behavior. And so again, 
from us, thank you. 

BS Well thank you. Because you are rais-
ing the bar, you’re providing perspective 
in judgment and resources and tools that 
all of us benefit from. And I think while 
we’re excited about the things we’re doing 
today, I’m sure the only thing that really 
will keep us at the forefront for any time 
is a sense of humility, a recognition that 
the border keeps changing in terms of 
what we have to accomplish. A new fron-
tier, if you will, and you’re going to help us 
identify where we need to go. So thank 
you. 

Then, you need to work with people. It’s 
one of the things that David Howard has 
been really championing here in Micro-
soft. Integrity is both a set of values, but 
it’s a skill. It’s a skill that we need to invest 
in helping people learn because that to ac-
tually often requires the ability to spot an 
issue, to have judgment and how to think 
about it and the courage to know when to 
raise your voice inside a company and say 
this would be a problem if we did it. We 
better think again. 

TE How how do you stay true to your 
values in a 24/7, 365 day a year news en-
vironment? 

BS Well, it’s such an interesting question 
and I think it’s such fundamental impor-
tance in the world today to be able to 
move quickly and make decisions and 
then communicate. At one level it’s easier 
if you know what you stand for, if you 
know your values. But I do think it re-
quires a couple of other things as well. 

It does require this sense of courage that 
we’ve been talking about. I think it actual-
ly requires a dose of humility because you 
have to recognize, especially when you’re 
moving fast, you’re not going to get every-
thing right. You’re going to get some ar-
rows shot back at you. That’s OK. We’re all 
going to continue to learn and grow and 
perfection isn’t for this time and place.  

I think the third thing that really re-
quires, and in some ways, this is the part 
that companies may not always think 
through, is that you need to have clear 
processes and decision-making set up 
so things can move fast if necessary. It 
was literally the Sunday afternoon of La-
bor Day weekend and I had been on the 
phone with the White House, trying to 
dissuade them from taking the step on 
DACA and recognizing that we were not 
going to be successful. All right. We then 
knew we had 24, 36 hours to decide what 
we wanted to say, to write it up in a blog, 

trust. I think it does help us because then 
people say yes, I feel comfortable relying 
on this company for technology that is so 
important to me or to my business. 

TE Microsoft is a middle-aged company. 
You’re 50, a little bit more. 

BS We’re under 50! I want you to know 
that we’re only about 43 years old. 

TE Oh, OK. What characteristics would 
you say, if you’re going to be here for the 
next 43, 50, a hundred years, what char-
acteristics would you say that a compa-
ny would have to have as a foundation?  

BS I think right now at Microsoft, we’re 
focused fundamentally on two things 
and I think that they serve us well and 
they hopefully will continue to serve us 
well. 

The first is what Satya Nadella, the CEO, 
has talked about as a growth mindset. 
You know, this comes from Carol Dweck 
at Stanford, and some great research 
and thinking in the social sciences. The 
basic thesis is that we all benefit from 
constantly challenging ourselves, recog-
nizing that most of our abilities are not 
fixed. We have more we can learn every 
day. It’s OK to try and fail and learn and 
grow, and then reward that constant 
learning. 

Now, the key, I think especially when you 
think about the kinds of issues that Ethi-
sphere deals with, is to combine a growth 
mindset with a clear understanding that 
there are some risks that you should not 
take. There are some values that are so 
steadfast that you must never sacrifice 
them. As we like to say inside Microsoft, 
there are lots of risks that are inherent 
in being in business, but don’t take integ-
rity risk. Don’t put your integrity at risk. 
Don’t do it as an individual. Don’t do it for 
your team or your department or your 
company. 
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